
Rectangular Independent Pedestal
Picnic Table with Perforated Steel

$1,891.00

Product Description
This Rectangular Independent Pedestal Picnic Table
with Perforated Steel has a surface made up of lots
of small circular holes so that rainwater can drip
straight through instead of sitting on the surface.
This means that even though it has just rained, kids
and adults can sit down without getting wet. The
structure can be installed in one of two ways. You
can order it with plates that are fastened onto a
smooth and level concrete surface, or you can
choose to have it installed in the ground to your
desired height. You can choose the size you want
too, with a 6ft table seating approximately eight
people and an 8ft table giving room for up to ten
people. This makes it ideal for outdoor spaces where
people want to enjoy a family or neighborhood BBQ,
celebrate a special occasion, or seat multiple
children to teach them in an outdoor setting. Select
from lots of colors to suit your requirements, with a
Standard or Extreme coating.

Product Specifications
Price: $1,891.00

Model Number: TRT06-D-10-000 
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