
Octagon Rolled Nexus Pedestal
Table with Perforated Steel

$2,185.00

Product Description
The Octagon Rolled Nexus Pedestal Table with
Perforated Steel offers both comfort and style. It
comes with rounded bench seats without any sharp
edges. This way, it’s safe for folks bringing kids to
the park. The rolled edges cradle legs and keep
visitors relaxed. Every bench stands alone so guests
can move freely. Due to its spacious legroom,
everyone can enjoy their meals or conversations
without feeling cramped. Since there is no backrest,
guests can easily turn around to attend to their kids
and continue their activity at the table afterward.
The Octagon Rolled Nexus Pedestal Table with
Perforated Steel is also very durable. It can bear any
weather condition without any wear and tear for
years. The protective coating on the table is the
reason why it always looks pristine. This coating will
protect it from rust and corrosion. It also comes in
different colors so that you can choose the one that
fits your area’s theme or vibe.

Product Specifications
Price: $2,185.00

Model Number: TOR46-D-47-000 

618-314-8007 | SWINGSETFACTORYDEPOT.COM



618-314-8007 | SWINGSETFACTORYDEPOT.COM


